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How To Use Gathering Foot Properly

The quickest way to prepare a fabric in a professional manner is to use a gathering foot.
The gathering foot allows the user to work in peace without dealing with sliding. With the
help of a gathering foot, now you are able to sew any fabric and ruffling. This tool will
allow you to create the best thing at your best basic sewing machine.

Today I will tell you about the gathering foot and how you can use it properly. However,
before we get started, I highly suggest you check out the best basic sewing machine
reviews at CraftsSelection.com to choose the right sewing machine if you are a starter. 

How to Attach a Gathering Foot:

The presser foot and shank which are already attached to the sewing machine need to
be removed before attaching the gathering foot. At the time of attaching the gathering
foot to the sewing machine, make sure the presser bar is fixed properly to the machine.
Once you are done with the presser bar and gathering foot, tighten the screw properly
and secure it.

Gathering and Tension:

To get the right appearance, what you need to do is to cut the ruffle a bit longer and
then to trim the excess one after being done with the sewing. In this way, you don’t
have to set up the adjustment option.

Now you don’t have to take any stress regarding the ruffle and tension of the sewing
machine. I recommend you measure the strip for the ruffle and then cut 1-2 inches more
from the fabric. Furthermore, you should definitely click here if you want to know What Is
The Best Beginner Sewing Machine where we provide you helpful guides to the best
beginner sewing machine you should invest in.

The speed of the Machine:

When you have successfully attached the gathering foot to the sewing machine, now
you have to follow one more thing: the machine's speed.

In case you work at a faster pace then nothing will be in a good position for you and in
the end, you have to adjust the piece of fabric again due to the fact that you didn’t do
anything with the settings of the machine.

The thickness of the Fabric:

Another thing which you should pay attention to is the thickness of the fabric. The
thickness of the fabric can affect the whole sewing so in this case you should choose
the correct needle and focus on the work. Also, you’re supposed to focus on the nature
of the fabric.
Verdict
In sewing, every small tool has its own importance so once you start using it, you will get
to know how amazing it will be and how it can change your work into something
wonderful.
Gathering foot is something that should be in the sewing kit of every sewer who is a
beginner and trying to sew something like skirts or dresses. In addition, to gain more
useful knowledge about the top rated sewing machines for beginners, you should have
a look at CraftsSelection to read comprehensive sewing machine reviews and buying
guides.
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